CRO #1651 BULK COARSE SALT

BID TAB

2 p.m. CDT

Sodium Chloride

Sodium Chloride

Salt F.O.B. Salt Picked up F.O.B. Picked up
Morton Salt Inc NO BID NO BID $ 13718  $ 137.00
Compass Minerals NO BID NO BID $ 151.30 $ 147.00
Dycho Company NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Pr: e

Secondary
CRO# 1652 Water Line Supplies
BID TAB
3/25/2025 2 p.m.
Consolidated Pipe & Supply Co. Ferrguson Southern Pipe &
Inc. G&C Supply Co Waterworks Supply Knox
Saddles (Smith Blair) |
2" x 3/4" cc $ 18.98 | § 18177 $ 3245 | % 61.37
2'x1"cc $ 18.98 | $ 18.17 | $ 3245 | § 61.37
3"x3/4" cc $ 2282 | § 2164 | $ 3917 | § 68.10
3"x1"cc $ 22.82 | § 2164 | % 3917 [ $ 68.10
32" .P.T. $ 30.90 | $ 30.31 | $ 53.59 | § 73.79
4" x 3/4" cc $ 30.50 | § 26.53 | $ 4216 | $ 68.37
4"x 1" cc $ 3050 | $ 26.53 | $ 4216 | $ 68.37
4" x2".P.T. $ 39.50 | $ 3550 | % 50.66 | $ 75.79
6" x 3/4" cc $ 3450 | $ 2963 3% 4243 | $ 79.39
6"x 1" cc $ 3450 | $ 2963 % 4243 | $ 79.39
6" x2".P.T. $ 39.50 | $ 35.15 | § 5417 | % 85.68
8" x 3/4" cc $ 4577 | % 38.02 $ 53.41 | % 91.00
8"x1"cc $ 4577 | $ 38.02 % 5341 | % 91.00
8"x2"1.P.T. $ 4845 | § 4280 % 73.83 | % 97.89
10" x 3/4" cc $ 48.35 | $ 4435 | $ 71.89 | $ 109.88
10" x 1" cc $ 48.35 | $ 4435 | % 71.89 | % 109.88
10" x 2" L.P.T. $ 57.02 | $ 56.45 | $ 99.24 | § 119.64
12" x 3/4" cc $ 56.89 | $ 53.20 | $ 7270 | § 114.33
12%x 1"ce $ 56.89 | § 53.20 | $ 7270 | $ 114.33
12" x 2" L.P.T. $ 68.00 | $ 67.67 | % 93.84 | § 128.67
14" x 3/4" cc $ 114.95 | § 9715 | § 88.95 | % 121.88
14" x 1" cc $ 114.95 | $ 97.15 | 88.95 | § 121.88
14" x 2" |.P.T, $ 127.85 | $ 12454 | $ 108.33 | $ 140.69
16" x 3/4" cc 3 120.00 | $ 99.35 | § 105.57 | $ 145.11
16" x 1" cc $ 120.00 | $ 99.35 | § 105.57 | $ 145.11
16" x 2" |.P.T. $ 128.00 | $ 12403 | § 130.76 | $ 160.52
\

Master Meter 5/8" x 3/4" % 267.50 NO BID | NO BID NO BID |




Master Meter 1" $ 346.06 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Master Meter 1 1/2" $ 696.47 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
2" Meter with flange connector $ 916.96 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
2" DB compound meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
3" DB compound meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
4" DB compound meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Corp Stops (Ford) 3/4" F1000-3-Q NL $ 39.88 | $ 39.16 | § 46.84 | $ 36.51
Corp Stops (Ford) 3/4" FB1000-3-Q NL, 300 F $ 59.00 | $ 57.95 | $ 69.32 | $ 54.03
Coupling for 3/4" service tubing brass $ 2226 | % 2187 ' $ 26.16 | $ 20.39
3/4" PE Municipex CTS Service Tubing 500' @ $425 OR $.85/FT | $ 450.00  $465 OR $.93/FT | $ 545.00
1" PE Municipex CTS Service Tubing 500' coi $625 OR $1.25/FT | § 690.00 | $700 OR $1.40/FT | $ 795.00
Smith Blair 3/4" x 3" full circle clamp for servic $ 2025 | % 19.77 | $ 45.37 NO BID
18" plastic meter box (Carson-Brooks) plastic| $ 4750 | $ 66.64 | $ 59.211|9% 40.25
3/4" Meter yokes (Ford) 7" rise $ 207.74 | $ 199.41 | $ 24521 | $ 191.14
|
Brass Saddles (Ford) '
2" x 3/4" $ 30.20 | 2433 | § 29.37 | § 23.07
2"x 1" $ 30.20 | $ 2433 | $ 2937 | $ 23.07
4" x 3/4" $ 38.85 | $ 38.12 ' $ 4559 | § 35.82
4" x 1" $ 38.85 | § 38.12 § 4559 | $ 35.82
4" x 2" 3 8364 % 82.09 $ 98.20 | $ 77.14
6" x 3/4" $ 57.95 | $ 56.87 ' $ 68.03 | $ 53.44
6" x 1" % 57.95 | $ 56.87 3 68.03 | $ 53.44
6" x 2" $ 109.34 | $ 107.31 | $ 128.36 | $ 100.83
8" x 3/4" $ 7963 | $ 78.16 | $ 93.49 | $ 73.44
8" x 1" 5 79.63 | $ 78.16 | $ 93.49 | $ 73.44
10" x 3/4" $ 153.64 | $ 148.05 | $ 180.37 | $ 141.69
10" x 1" 3 153.64 | $ 148.05 ; $ 180.37 | $ 141.69
2" Ford Setter w/ball valve, w/check valve & bl $ 1,22885 | $ 1,183.84 | $ 1,442.00 | $ 1,121.07
2" Ford Setter w/ball valve, wicheck valve & b, $ 1,267.11 | % 1,221.89 | § 1,386.51 | § 1,170.39
17" x 30" plastic meter box 18" $ 155.00 | $ 24904 | $ 197.37 | $ 166.67
15" concrete meter box w/C1 readerfliplid | $ 55.00 | $ 5439  $ 53.53 | § 199.99
1" Ford meter yoke 10" rise w/double check f
valve w/locking ball valve $ 353.93 | $ 34193 | $ 416.58 | $ 323.80
Master Meter Register 5/8" USG 3G DS-Optig $ 203.85 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Master Meter Register 5/8" USG 3G DS-Intery $ 212.75 NO BID | NO BID NO BID




Octave Meters:

2" Octave Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3" Octave Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
4" Octave Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
6" Octave Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
2" Octave Meter $ 1,802.65 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
3" Octave Meter $ 2,239.80 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
4" Octave Meter $ 2,980.52 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
6" Octave Meter $ 4,732.36 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
3G DS Encoder XTR 199-004-50 $ 150.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3G DS Encoder Module 965-010-16 $ 177.00 NOBID | NO BID NO BID
DLG 3G DS Fast Pulse DLG 199-004-57 $ 152.48 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Octobe Double Pulse Output ADA 965-010-1¢ $ 285.00 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
|

Badger Meters: i

Badger, M25, 5/8" X 3/4" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Badger M55, 1" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger M120, 1-1/2" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Badger, M170, 2" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Badger, 2" T-200 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Badger, 3" T-450 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Badger, 4" T-1000 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Badger, 6" T-2000 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Badger, 2" Compound Series Meter, NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Badger, 3" Compound Series Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Badger, 4" Compound Series Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Badger, 6" Compound Series Meter NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID




VENDOR

Corechem Inc.

Univar Solutions.
Shannon Chemical Corp.
Chemrite Inc*

Brenntag Mid-South*
Dycho Company Inc*
Hawkins Inc

Carus LLC

Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc.

PVS Minibulk, Inc.
United Mineral & Chemical Corp.
Thermodyne Engineering Inc.

CAUSTIC
(GAL)-50%
$3.2200
$5.2200
no bid

no bid
$3.5110
$3.5700
$4.6000
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

CAUSTIC
(GAL)-25%
$1.2310
$1.1722
no bid

no bid
$1.1300
$1.5100
no bid

no bid

no bid
$1.7100
no bid

no bid

CRO #1655 Water Treatment Chemicals
3/25/2025 2 P.M. CDT

ZINC-ORTHO
PHOSPHATE FLUROSILICIC
(GAL)>ID (GALLON) 23%
no bid $4.4210
no bid $3.8000
$8.0700 no bid
no bid no bid
$18.5300 $3.5100
$8.9800 $3.4800
no bid $5.5700
$7.9200 no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid

SODIUM
BICARBONATE
(POUND)
$0.4500
$0.7100
no bid

no bid
$0.3690
$0.4100
no bid

no bid
$0.3700
no bid

no bid

no bid

GRANULAR SALT POLYMER
BULK (POUND) (GALLON)

$0.1360 no bid
$0.1850 no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
$0.1750 $4.4400
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid no bid
no bid $4.6510

SODIUM
PERMANGANATE
20% Tote
no bid
$11.7000
$17.1700
$11.0900
$13.4850
$11.1000
$15.2100
no bid

no bid

no bid
$10.4500
no bid

SODIUM NORIT
THIOSULFATE PAC
(GALLON) (POUND)
$4.1000 no bid
no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid
$3.4490 no bid
$3.4900 $1.3700
$8.2200 no bid
no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

no bid no bid



CRO #1656 Fertilizer

3/25/2025 2:00 p.m. CDT
Site One Landscape Supply - Knoxville

The Hogan Company

Quantity Bag Ton Total
07/01/2025 Delivery
LESCO 33-0-3 50% U-PLUS BIO 2Fe 50# (Alt. for 33-3-5 no
longer available) 90 $25.5730 $2,301.57
LESCO 32-0-8 40% NOS PLUS BIO 2Fe 50# (Alt. for 32-3-8) 74 $25.9890 $1,923.19
Fertilizer/Insecticide 0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067% 105 $39.6160 $4,159.68
LESCO 18-24-12 25% NOS PLUS BIO 50# (Alt. for 18-24-12 25%
SCU) 130 $27.5870 $3,586.31
03/01/2026 Delivery
Dimension .15% 19-0-6 30% Polyplus LESCO (Alt. for 19-0-6 with
.15 dimension) 148 $27.2390 $4,031.37
21-0-0 AS Mpac Compacted SGN 170 95 $34.8060 $3,306.57
Fertilizer/Insecticide 0-0-7 plus Acelepryn 0.067% 105 $39.6160 $4,159.68
05/03/2026 Delivery
Dimension .15% 19-0-6 30% Polyplus LESCO (Alt. for 19-0-6 with
.15 dimension) 153 $27.2390 $4,167.57
Fertilizer 5-10-31 A/C with 10% FE 50 $15.1560 $757.80
LESCO 33-0-3 50% U-PLUS BIO 2Fe 50# (Alt. for 33-3-5 no
longer available) 90 $25.5730 $2,301.57

$ 30,695.31

Quantity Bag Ton Total

07/01/2025 Delivery

TFC MTO 35-3-5 FERTILIZER 50LB 90 $20.63 $1,856.70
TFC MTO 32-3-8 30% SCU 2% FE FERT. 50LB 74 $24.38 $1,804.12
Lebabon Pro 0-0-7 .067% Acelepryn MOP SNG 220 105 $43.68 $4,586.40
TFC MTO 18-24-12 Starter Fert. 25% SCU 130 $25.63 $3,331.90
03/01/2026 Delivery

Lebabon Pro 17-0-0 0.15% Dimension 50LB 148 $32.16 $4,759.68
21-0-0 Ammonium Sulfate Fert. SGN 220 50LB 95 $19.38 $1,841.10
Lebabon Pro 0-0-7 .067% Acelepryn MOP SNG 220 105 $43.68 $4,586.40
05/03/2026 Delivery

Lebabon Pro 17-0-0 0.15% Dimension 50LB 153 $32.16 $4,920.48
TFC MTO 5-10-31 10% fe SNG 220 50LB 50 $22.50 $1,125.00
TFC MTO 35-3-5 FERTILIZER 50LB 90 $20.63 $1,856.70

$ 30,668.48




CRO #1657 Tires & Installation

BID TAB
3/25/2025 2 p.m. CDT
Shadden Tire Best One
Passenger and light truck tires $ 18.99 $ 40.00
Medium truck tires $ 35.00 $ 85.00
Medium truck tires with Dayton wheels $ 35.00 $ 98.25
Industrial tires up to 18" wheel $ 20.00 ' $ 65.00
Industrial tires greater than 18" wheel $ 20.00 $ 75.00




CRO #1658 Pest Control

BID TAB

3/25/2025 2 p.m. CDT

Prices per Treatment

Bug Busters Inc. Dodson Pest Control = Lookout Pest Control
City Hall $ 40.00 $ 65.00 $ 16.80
Police Department $ 40.00  $ 55.00 | $ 16.80
Fire Department $ 35.00 $ 55.00 $ 16.80
Recreational Buildings $ 30.00 $ 55.00 $ 16.80
Palace Theater $ 45,00 $ 55.00 $ 16.80
Crossville Depot $ 30.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 16.80
Public Works:
Maintenance Dept. and Bays $ 25.00  $ 15.00  $ 10.60
Street Dept. and Kitchen $ 25.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 10.60
Public Works Office and Kitchen $ 25.00 $ 15.00 $ 10.60
Utilities Maintenance and Kitchen $ 2500 $ 15.00 §$ 10.60
*963 City Lake Rd $ 125.00
*105 Holiday Dr $ 90.00
Fire Station #2 $ 20.00 $ 55.00 $ 16.80
Meadow Park Lake Office $ 10.00  $ 55.00 $ 16.80
Airport Terminal Building $ 4500 $ 55.00 $ 16.80
Veolia $ 2500 $ 55.00 $ 16.80
SEASONAL TREATMENTS:
Centennial Park (3) Concessions Buildings and Restrooms  $ 35.00 $ 55.00 $ 24.30
Meadow Park Lake Bath House $ 20.00 $ 20.00 $ 8.10
Meadow Park Lake (2) Cabins $ 20.00 ' $ 20.00 ' $ 16.20
Meadow Park Lake
Maintenance Storage $ 20.00 $ 20.00 $ 8.10
Duer Soccer Complex $ 20.00 ' $ 55.00 $ 8.10
Garrison Park $ 20.00 ' $ 55.00 $ 16.20
MONTHLY TOTAL $ 555.00 | $ 1,060.00  $ 291.40

NOTE - 963 City Lake Rd. and 105 Holiday Dr. these were added as an addendum to the bid




CRO #1659 Street Striping

BID TAB

3/25/2025 2 p.m.

Company
Volunteer Highway Supply Co. Inc.

4" line (per foot) $ 0.10
6" line (per foot) $ 0.15
Thermoplastic:

24" Stop Bar (per foot) $ 12.00
12" crosswalk (per foot) $ 22.00
Turn/straight arrows (each) $ 350.00
4" white or yellow line (per foot) $ 0.75
Rumble strips (per foot) $ 8.00
Word message (per letter) $ 35.00
Single Turn Arrow (each) $ 225.00




Bid Opening - CRO#1660 Cold Milling Re-Bid.

04-22-2025 2 p.m.

Company

Total

Rogers Group Inc.

36.00

Per ton to remove and retain
milings from site

35.00

Per ton for City to retain millings
and have delivered to our location




Bid Opening - CRO #1663 Water Treatment Chemical - Coagulant

04-22-2025 2 p.m.

Company

Total

Thermodyne Engineering, Inc.

4.651




CRO #1664 Asphalt Delivered

5/27/2025 14:00
Company 411E (Per Ton) 307C (Per Ton)
Rogers Group Inc. S 118.00 S 115.00



CRO #1665 Asphalt Picked-Up

5/27/2025 14:00
Company 411E (Per Ton) 307C (Per Ton)
Rogers Group Inc. S 95.00 S 85.00





