CRO# 1652 Water Line Supplies

BID TAB

3/25/2025 2 p.m.

Consolidated Pipe & Supply Co. Ferrguson Southern Pipe &
Inc. G&C Supply Co Waterworks Supply Knox

Saddles (Smith Blair)
2" x 3/4" cc $ 18.98 $ 1817 § 3245 | § 61.37
2"x 1" cc $ 18.98 $ 18.17 § 3245 $ 61.37
3" x 3/4" cc $ 2282 § 2164 | § 39.17 | § 68.10
3"x1"cc $ 2282 § 2164 $ 3917  $ 68.10
3"x2"L.P.T. $ 3090 | $ 30.31 | § 53.59 | § 73.79
4" x 3/4" cc $ 30.50 $ 26.53 $ 4216 § 68.37
4"x 1" cc $ 30.50 | $ 26.53 | § 4216 $ 68.37
4"x 2" 1.P.T. $ 39.50 $ 3550 $ 50.66 $ 75.79
6" x 3/4" cc $ 3450 | $ 2963 | § 4243  § 79.39
6" x 1" cc $ 3450 $ 2963 $ 4243 § 79.39
6" x 2" I.P.T. $ 39.50 | $ 3515 | § 5417 | § 85.68
8" x 3/4" cc $ 4577 | $ 38.02 $ 5341 $ 91.00
8" x1"cc $ 4577 | $ 38.02 | § 53.41 | § 91.00
8"x2"I.P.T. $ 48.45 | $ 4280 $ 73.83 $ 97.89
10" x 3/4" cc $ 48.35 | § 4435 § 71.89 | § 109.88
10" x 1" cc $ 4835 § 4435  § 71.89 | § 109.88
10" x 2" I.P.T. $ 57.02 | § 56.45 | § 99.24 | § 119.64
12" x 3/4" cc $ 56.89 $ 5320 $ 7270 $ 114.33
12" x 1" cc $ 56.89 | § 53.20 | § 7270 | § 114.33
12" x 2" I.P.T. $ 68.00 | $ 67.67 | $ 93.84 | § 128.67
14" x 3/4" cc $ 11495 $ 97.15 | § 88.95  § 121.88
14" x 1" cc $ 11495 $ 9715 $ 88.95 | § 121.88
14" x 2" I.P.T. $ 12785 $ 124.54 $ 108.33 $ 140.69
16" x 3/4" cc $ 120.00 $ 9935 $ 105.57 $ 145.11
16" x 1" cc $ 120.00 $ 99.35 | § 105.57 $ 145.11
16" x 2" I.P.T. $ 128.00 $ 124.03 | $ 130.76  $ 160.52
Master Meter 5/8" x 3/4" $ 267.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID




Master Meter 1" $ 346.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Master Meter 1 1/2" $ 696.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2" Meter with flange connector $ 916.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2" DB compound meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3" DB compound meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4" DB compound meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Corp Stops (Ford) 3/4" F1000-3-Q NL $ 39.88 | § 39.16 | § 46.84 § 36.51
Corp Stops (Ford) 3/4" FB1000-3-Q NL, 300 F $ 59.00 | $ 5795 $ 69.32 | § 54.03
Coupling for 3/4" service tubing brass $ 2226 ' $ 2187 $ 26.16 | $ 20.39
3/4" PE Municipex CTS Service Tubing 500' ¢ $425 OR $.85/FT  $ 450.00 | $465 OR $.93/FT $ 545.00
1" PE Municipex CTS Service Tubing 500' coi $625 OR $1.25/FT | $ 690.00 $700 OR $1.40/FT $ 795.00
Smith Blair 3/4" x 3" full circle clamp for servic $ 2025 ' $ 19.77 | $ 45.37 NO BID
18" plastic meter box (Carson-Brooks) plastic| $ 4750 | $ 66.64 $ 5921 $ 40.25
3/4" Meter yokes (Ford) 7" rise $ 207.74  $ 199.41 § 24521 $ 191.14
Brass Saddles (Ford)

2" x 3/4" $ 30.20 | $ 2433 | § 2937 § 23.07
2"x 1" $ 3020 $ 2433 | § 2937 § 23.07
4" x 3/4" $ 38.85 | § 38.12 | § 4559 § 35.82
4" x 1" $ 38.85 $ 3812 $ 4559 | $ 35.82
4" x 2" $ 8364 | § 82.09 | § 98.20 | $ 77.14
6" x 3/4" $ 5795 $ 56.87 $ 68.03 $ 53.44
6" x 1" $ 5795 | § 56.87 | $ 68.03 | $ 53.44
6" x 2" $ 109.34 $ 107.31 ' $ 128.36 $ 100.83
8" x 3/4" $ 79.63 | § 78.16 | § 93.49 | § 73.44
8" x1" $ 7963 $ 7816 $ 9349 $ 73.44
10" x 3/4" $ 153.64 $ 148.05 $ 180.37 $ 141.69
10" x 1" $ 153.64 $ 148.05  $ 180.37 $ 141.69
2" Ford Setter w/ball valve, w/check valve & b $ 1,228.85 | $ 1,183.84 | $ 1,442.00  $ 1,121.07
2" Ford Setter w/ball valve, w/check valve & b $ 1,267.11  § 1,221.89 § 1,386.51 §$ 1,170.39
17" x 30" plastic meter box 18" $ 155.00 | $ 249.04 | $ 197.37 | $ 166.67
15" concrete meter box w/C1 reader flip lid $ 55.00 $ 5439 $ 5353 $ 199.99
1" Ford meter yoke 10" rise w/double check

valve w/locking ball valve $ 353.93 $ 34193 $ 416.58 $ 323.80
Master Meter Register 5/8" USG 3G DS-Optic $ 203.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Master Meter Register 5/8" USG 3G DS-Interj $ 212.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID




Octave Meters:

2" Octave Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3" Octave Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4" Octave Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6" Octave Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2" Octave Meter $ 1,802.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3" Octave Meter $ 2,239.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4" Octave Meter $ 2,980.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6" Octave Meter $ 4,732.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3G DS Encoder XTR 199-004-50 $ 150.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3G DS Encoder Module 965-010-16 $ 177.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
DLG 3G DS Fast Pulse DLG 199-004-57 $ 152.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Octobe Double Pulse Output ADA 965-010-1¢ $ 285.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger Meters:

Badger, M25, 5/8" X 3/4" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger M55, 1" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger M120, 1-1/2" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger, M170, 2" Disc Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger, 2" T-200 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger, 3" T-450 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger, 4" T-1000 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger, 6" T-2000 Turbo Series Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger, 2" Compound Series Meter, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger, 3" Compound Series Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger, 4" Compound Series Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Badger, 6" Compound Series Meter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




