

Asphalt Delivered (Hot Mix)
CRO #1612
5/23/2023
2 p.m. CDT

	411-E	307-C
Rogers Group	\$ 122.00	\$ 118.50

Asphalt Picked Up
CRO #1612
5/23/2023
2 p.m. CDT

	411-E	307-C
Rogers Group	\$ 122.00	\$ 118.50

**BULK COARSE SALT
CRO #1612
5/23/2023
2 p.m. CDT**

	Salt F.O.B.	Salt Picked up	Sodium Chloride F.O.B.	Sodium Chloride Picked up
Morton Salt Inc	No bid \$ 122.00	No bid	\$ 127.56 \$ 118.50	\$ 125.00
Compass Minerals	No bid	No bid	\$ 130.52	\$ 123.00
Cargill Inc.	No bid	No bid	\$ 120.82	\$ 110.00
Univar	\$ 353.80	No bid	No bid	No bid

Cold Milling
CRO #1612
5/23/2023
2 p.m. CDT

	Per ton to remove and retain millings	Per ton for City to retain millings and have delivered
Rogers Group	\$ 122.00	\$ 118.50
PRi of East TN	\$ 50.00	\$ 45.00

COLD MIX
CRO #1612
5/23/2023
2 p.m. CDT

	Pick-Up per ton	Delivered per ton	
PRI of East TN	\$ 125.00	\$ 155.00	
	122		118.5
Hudson Materials	\$ 76.00	\$ 96.00	*CRS-2 for City patcher: \$2.50 FOB

Crushed Stone
 CRO #1612
 5/23/2023
 2 p.m. CDT

	33C	3/4 inch	1 1/2 inch	1/2 inch	1/4 inch	Rip Rap	RCA 02 2 X 4	RCA 71 4 X 6
(Delivered to Public Works)	#####			\$ 118.50				
Rogers Group	\$ 13.25	\$ 17.50	No bid	\$ 17.50	No bid	\$ 18.00	No bid	No Bid
Lhoist North America of TN	\$ 14.00	\$ 18.70	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.70	\$ 14.25	No bid	No bid	\$ 18.75

	33C	3/4 inch	1 1/2 inch	1/2 inch	1/4 inch	Rip Rap	RCA 02 2 X 4	RCA 71 4 X 6
(Picked up by City truck)								
Rogers Group	\$ 8.25	\$ 12.50	no bid	\$ 12.50	no bid	\$ 13.00	no bid	no bid
Lhoist North America of TN	\$ 9.25	\$ 13.95	\$ 13.25	\$ 13.95	\$ 9.50	no bid	No bid	\$ 14.00

#2 Stone
1-1/2" x 3"

\$ 17.50

\$ 18.70

#2 Stone
1-1/2" x 3"

\$ 12.50

\$ 13.95