

| | | | | | |
|--|-----------|-----------|--|-----------------------------|----------|
| Drug Screens | | | | | |
| CRO #1415 | | | | | |
| 5/16/2017 | | | | | |
| 2:00 p.m. | | | | | |
| | Fast Pace | Urgent | | TN Drug & Alcohol, Inc. | |
| | Non-CDL | CDL | | Non-CDL | CDL |
| Random-Safety Sensitive Employees | \$ 50.00 | \$ 50.00 | | \$ 45.00 | \$ 45.00 |
| Random-CDL | | \$ 50.00 | | | \$ 45.00 |
| Blood Alcohol-CDL | | \$ 45.00 | | | \$ 25.00 |
| Drug Screens: | | | | | |
| Post-Accident w/injury | \$ 25.00 | \$ 50.00 | | \$ 45.00 | \$ 45.00 |
| Post-Accident w/o injury | \$ 25.00 | \$ 50.00 | | \$ 45.00 | \$ 45.00 |
| Reasonable Suspicion | \$ 25.00 | \$ 50.00 | | \$ 45.00 | \$ 45.00 |
| Outside regular office hours | \$ 25.00 | \$ 50.00 | | \$ 45.00 | \$ 45.00 |
| Post-Employment Offer drug screen w/physical (including TB skin test & blood type, if necessary) | \$ 95.00 | \$ 110.00 | | no bid | no bid |
| Post-Employment Offer w/drug screen, pulmonary function test & FIT test (firemen only) | \$ 110.00 | \$ 110.00 | | no bid | no bid |
| Annual Respiratory FIT test (police and fire) | \$ 25.00 | \$ 25.00 | | no bid | no bid |
| Chain of custody | \$ 50.00 | | | | |
| Turn-around time | | | | 24 hours | |
| MRO & Laboratory | | | | MRO-John Tetrick/Medtox Lab | |
| C.L.I.A. certified | | | | N/A | |