
Galvanized Pipe-Street Dept
CRO #1390
8/23/2016
2:00 p.m.
Price Contract through 6/30/17

Tays, Inc.
 Johnstone

Supply Feed Store
12" 16 gauge 9.62$       14.94$         7.32$             
12" band 9.62$       8.00$            7.32$             

15" 16 gauge 11.89$     18.55$         9.27$             
15" band 11.89$     6.34$            9.27$             

18" 16 gauge 13.71$     22.32$         11.03$           
18" band 13.71$     8.87$            11.03$           

21" 16 gauge No bid 26.11$         No bid
21" band No bid 8.20$            No bid

24" 16 gauge 17.37$     29.72$         14.60$           
24" band 17.37$     11.60$         14.60$           

36" 16 gauge 26.10$     44.66$         21.77$           
36" band 26.10$     16.74$         21.77$           


	Galvanized Pipe

